BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Madison County, Mississippi

E-911 Administration Office 146 W. Center Street, Room 203, PO Box 608, Canton, MS 39046
T: (601) 859-6485 F:(601) 859-4743

DATE: January 21, 2015
TO: Madison County Board of Supervisors
FROM: Butch Hammack
Emergency Management Office
RE; Road Claim
LaShonda Roby

Davis Crossing

After further investigation on the above referenced claim, it is the recommendation of the
Emergency Management Office to approve and pay the claim to the order of LaShonda Roby
in the amount of $377.42 for stated repairs. If any further information is needed, please
contact our office.

Reported area was not repaired within the 7 day period allotted per Madison County Road
Claim Policy.
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ROAD CLAIM INCIDENT REPORT
In order to process the claim, please print & fill out completely and return to Madlson Co. EMA ofﬂce along
with two sngned estimates for damages bemg clalmed All requrred paperwork must be returned within 7
days of incident. NOTE Our pollcy isa relmbursement polrcy We DO NOT replace nor arrange to have any
repairs made Itis to your own dtscretion to when the repairs are made lf your claimi is approved a
relmbursement check will mailed to you at the given address glven below.
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UptonTire Pros

2019 Strawberry Hill

Madison, MS 39110

Phone: (601) 856-8473 / Fax: (601) 856-7259
Web: uptontirepros.com

Contact: George Bennett

Email: mike@uptontirepros.com
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January 6, 2015
Product Description Qty Retail Extended
151000270 P225/50R17/SL HAN DSB OPTIMO H725A 93S 50K 1 $138.99 $138.99
DISP/STTAX DISP/ST TAX 1 $4.00 $4.00
MBS MT/BAL/STEMS/SS 1 $15.00 $15.00
Book an appointment online at uptontirepros.com- Sub Total: $157.99
save time and MONEY'! Parts Tax: $10.78
Total: $168.77
Hankook Optimo
H725A
R

http://www.tireprosonline.com/tirepros.php?m=RetailQuote&action=print_quote&html_onl...

1/6/2015
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Hankook Optimo H725A

Specs/Size
SIZE P225/50R17SL
UTQGL 340 A A
SERVICE 938
SUPPLIER 1007078
MIN RIM WIDTH 6.0000
MAX RIM WIDTH 8.0000
OUTER DIAMETER 25.9
Single Max Load lbs 1433@44
Dual Max Load lbs NA
RPM 802
TREAD DEPTH 11
SHIP WEIGHT 23.600
SPECIAL NOTES

Features Benefits

* None Available * None Available

http://www.tireprosonline.com/tirepros.php?m=Retail Quote&action=print_quote&html onl... 1/6/2015



QUOTE
016046
01/06/2015

NO CUSTOMER

Store # 761374
Description

WHEELS
7017868 STEEL WHEEL

Prices valid for 30 days.

S

FIRESTONE COMPLETE AUTO CARE
1095 US HWY 51
MADISON, MS. 39110-9085

2008 CHEVROLET MALIBU LT

SERVICE ADVISOR:
01 DAN
601.853.3164

Page 1 of 1

LIC# VIN# 1G1ZH57B98F187664
IN 01/01/70 12:00AM EST. MILEAGE O
QUOTE -
Article ' Extended Job
. Number T# _Qty = Part Labor  Price  Total
01 195.00
7017868 1 195.00 195.00
Summary
Parts 195.00
Labor 0.00
Shop Supplies 0.00
Sub 195.00
Tax 13.65
il
Total /{ .65\.
L8793 T
THIS IS NOT AN INVOICE- DO NOT PAY 57732

Quote1 140731.4040
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ACCREDITED
BUSINESS

PTON
T PROScon

UPTON TIRE PROS-MADISON

2019 STRAWBERRY HILL DR
MADISON, MS 39110
601-856-8473 Fax 601-856-4045
madison@uptontirepros.com

LASHONDA ROBY
MADISON, MS 39110

RVICE SCHEDULE DATE DUE TIRE SAFETY CHECK
STEEL WHEEL WITH
SHOP SUPPLIES
SUBTOTAL
SALES TAX
CHECKLIST ITEM STATUS

TREAD DEPTH GOOD

FR. TIRE PRESSURE NOT CHECKED

RR. TIRE PRESSURE NOT CHECKED

TPMS OFF

TIRES TIGHTENED AND TORQUED | NOT APPLICABLE

2024497

Home:601-951-6127
Cell:601-951-6127
Work: Ext:

1 0.00

HUB COVER 1 25487 25487
20.39

275.26

19.27

CUSTOMER SIGNATURE
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Jennifer Taylor

From: Jennifer Taylor

Sent: Tuesday, January 06, 2015 5:00 PM
To: Helen Keller; 'Shirley Brown'
Subject: Road CLaim

We received a road claim on Davis Crossing. Landmark is down from KD One Stop Store. The cut off for
that would be 1/14/15. Please let me know of any status changes.

Thank you.

Jennifer carpenter
Administrative Assistant
Madison County Board of Supervisors
E-911 Administration
0: 601-855-5620
C: 601-259-2260



Jennifer Taylor

From: Helen Keller

Sent: Wednesday, January 21, 2015 9:50 AM
To: Jennifer Taylor; Shirley Brown

Subject: RE: Road Claim Follow ups

| faxed info to you on Virlilia Rd and Yandell Rd just now. | don’t see anything on Davis Crossing yet.

From: Jennifer Taylor

Sent: Wednesday, January 21, 2015 9:20 AM
To: Helen Keller; Shirley Brown

Subject: Road CLaim Follow ups

I have three road claims I am need to follow up and close out. One I called emailed and called about last
week on Davis Crossing. The other is on Yandell Rd. and the last one is Virillia Rd. Can you tell me if any
repairs have been made on these three, please.

T Jenwiifer Carpenter
Administrative Assistant
Madison County Board of Supervisors
E-911 Administration
0: 601-855-5620
C: 601-259-2260
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